Lot # Horse Name Breed Sire Dam Sex Age Color Selling Price Buyer Salutation Buyer Last Name
1 ANNIE LENNOX Half Arabian ISLAMORADA++ CALLAWAYS ANNIE LAURIE Mare 11 Bay $0.00 Heme no sale
2 SAPPHIRE BEY zZ Arabian AFIRE BEY V KLOISONNE Mare 14 Bay $1,000.00 Elizabeth A. Flanders
3 ISABELLE FM Arabian DA VINCI FM AUTUMN STAR FM Mare 2 Bay $0.00 no sale
4 BH BEYBERRY STORM Arabian HUCKLEBEY BERRY+/ RB FARRIS Gelding 11 Grey $7,200.00 Karen Marie Cochran
5 GHAZPACHO Half Arabian EL GHAZI DANCE TIL DAWN JD Gelding 6 Bay $4,600.00 Jeffrey S Svennies
6 M A ADONIS+// Arabian ZODIAC MATADOR LA ATHENA Gelding 13 Bay no sale
7 JOHNNY KARSON Arabian KIT KARSON V+/ MA FINAL FORCE Gelding 7 Bay $700.00 Elise F. Schwenn
8 AFIRES LEGEND Half Arabian REGGIE'S AMERICAN LEGEND |AFIRES EXPOSE Gelding 6 Chestnut $1,000.00 Phyllis Jo Ashley-Holden
9 TL MAGNUMS BREEZE Arabian MAGNUM PSYCHE ALI ANGELIQUE z Mare 5 Bay $7,800.00 Kathleen D. Berg
10 BAROSSA LRA Half Arabian DA VINCI FM GIRLS NITE OUT Gelding 4 Chestnut $0.00 no sale
11 EA MONEY HONEY Half Arabian/NSH JDM RAIN DANCE+/ MAKE A FORTUNE Mare 6 | Chestnut $10,000.00 Glenn Howard Garrett
12 REVELRY MM Half Arabian/NSH REVIVAL SNOWBILITY Mare 3 Chestnut $0.00 no bid
14 NOUVE O RICHE+/ Half Arabian NIGHT OF ROSES O KATIE Gelding 13 Bay $17,000.00 | Jeffrey S. Svennies
15 JUSTAWALK IN THE PARK Half Arabian JUSTAFIRE DGL SWF CENTRAL PARK+// Mare 4 Chestnut $1,100.00 Richard Simmons
16 STATUS CYMBELL Arabian HUCKLEBEY BERRY CYMBELL Mare 10 Grey $3,300.00 Elizabeth Flanders
17 LILLY OF GEMINI Half Arabian MAGNUM PSYCHE ZA PRIMAVERAH Mare 1| Chestnut $600.00 Matthew Lee Herder
18 RH POWER AND GLORY Half Arabian MAMAGE BEVY Mare 5/ Chestnut $1,200.00 Glenn Howard Garrett
19 TAMARAMERICANGRAFFITI Half Arabian SO EXCITED ER+/ FANACATION TALK Gelding 10 Chestnut $5,000.00 Jule Daniel-Adams
20 NATALS PRINCE Arabian EL GHAZI NATALS PRINCESS Gelding 8 Bay $3,000.00 Howard J. Booher
21 SA PUTIN ONTHE RITZ Half Arabian/NSH AE EXCEL CATHEDRAL BELLS Gelding 11 Chestnut $10,000.00 | Robert F. Janecki, Jr.
22 A SLICK CHARACTER Half Arabian SUNN WARRIOR XIA XIANNG Gelding 5 Black $500.00 Sandy Young
23 STRING OF PEARLS SCR Arabian AA APOLLO BEY NOBILITYS LADY DI Mare 4 Grey $4,100.00  Patricia Brown
24 BELLISSIMO GA Arabian FAUSTO CRH UNIC STAR JP Gelding 2 Chestnut $600.00 Daniel Bontrager
25 EA FRED ESTAIR Half Arabian/NSH JDM RAIN DANCE+// SANTANA'S LOVE AFFAIR Gelding 6 Chestnut $1,700.00 Joan Beverly Tuckey
26 DBLE EXPRESSO Arabian IXL NOBLE EXPRESS MADANSKA Gelding 5 Grey $2,600.00 Lisa Munson
27 DESPERADOS DIEGO Arabian DESPERADO V KONTESSA AMEER Gelding 11 Black $10,000.00 | Patricia Harper
28 UH OH Arabian AA APOLLO BEY VJ PERCEPTION Gelding 8 Grey $3,500.00 Kathleen D. Berg
29 CADIENCE Arabian ALLIENCE+// WHITE ZINFANDAL Gelding 8 Chestnut $0.00 no sale
30 VSH FEMMETJA Dutch Harness Horse NIGHT OF ROSES NIKITA J Mare 3 Bay $0.00 no sale
31 ASHELY erc;sbsian FAUSTO CRH GAYSKA ROSE JM Mare 3 Chestnut $800.00 Elise F. Schwenn
32 EA SHADY LADY Arabian A TEMPTATION EA CANDY GIRL Mare 5 Grey $0.00 no sale
33 DEE-LOVELY Half Arabian/NSH HUCKS HERITAGE V UNDULATA'S LADY DELIGHT Mare 7 Chestnut $5,000.00 Paula Jane Weekley
34 ANZA BOSSA NOVA Half Arabian ANZA PADRON BRAZIL Mare 4 Chestnut $5,000.00 Glenn Howard Garrett
35 WCSOMTHINGTOTALKABOUT | Half Arabian RENAISSANSE RW PADRON SHADOW ROSE | Gelding 6| Black Bay Tobiano $3,400.00 Jae Hadden
36 ARABIATTA Arabian ALLIENCE+// SAVANNAH BEY Z Gelding 7 Bay $1,200.00 Larissa Zaron
37 NOLA HPA Arabian MASTERPIECE V NUSANCE Mare 13 Bay $4,000.00 Jean Filleti
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BUCHAREST V
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BEY HAWKEYE
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LONITA (grade)
SJB DESTIMONA
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SOLDIERS SONG
HOLLYLUYA
KLOISONNE
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LUCKY PROWLER
MATTIE
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ROSA LINDA
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Bay

Bay
Chestnut
Chestnut
Grey
Black Tobiano
Palomino
Chestnut
Chestnut
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Chestnut
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Chestnut
Bay
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Chestnut
Bay
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Bay
Chestnut
Bay
Chestnut
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$2,900.00
$500.00
$1,100.00
$1,200.00
$5,300.00
$600.00
$1,100.00
$4,200.00
$5,500.00
$9,500.00
$0.00
$3,500.00
$3,000.00
$2,100.00
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Jane A.
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John S.
Patricia

Patricia
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Daniel-Adams
Creyts
Connelly
Goodrow
Garrett
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Maxwell
Bruni
Robinson
Hankins

no sale
Runde
Haggan
Goldstein
Patterson
Mutschelknaus
Lindley
Smiley
Connelly
Ginsberg
Stachowski
Koehler
Sarkozi

no bid

no bid
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Clark
Smith
Troutman
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Brown
Brown
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no bid
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KRA APOLLA BEY
MAZZALYNN D VA
NEW CREATION PA
COGNAC STARLETT
BUTTERFLY AFIRE
MATRIX PA

AL-MARAH TEMPTINGFAME

JUSTA DAY DREAM
RS BLACK BETTY
MASQUERA

PABLO VA
SENSATIONAL FIRE
WLF FIRE AND RAIN
LOVEGAME

ROSA LINDA

NOBLE BELLE
LATTITUDE PA
SPARKS OF THE STORM
RS FUNNY GIRL
PRECISELY VA
FANCY JUDY
SEDONAA

MI T JULLIET

RS NOBLE PRINCESS
CHANDU

WR FINNAGAN
NOBLE BENTLEY
WR-TANYA
BUTTERFLY ANGEL
RS NOBLE DUTCHESS
MAF REMEMBRANCE
SILVER DOLLAR PA
HS JUSTA DREAM
WR-SHANIA
MANHATTAN AFIRE
DKARTANYON

RS TRISTARR

Arabian
Arabian
Arabian
Arabian
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Arabian
Arabian

Half Arabian
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Arabian
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Half Arabian
Arabian
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Arabian
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Arabian
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Arabian
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AA APOLLO BEY
MAJOR DOLCE LV
PICAZSO

COGNAC

AFIRE BEY V
ARMANI FC

AM MICHAEL LOVE
JUSTIFY

IXL NOBLE EXPRESS
MASQUERADE

PA HI-EXPECTATIONS
FIRE AN ICE

DW BONFIRE
BUCHAREST V
HEINEKE

IXL NOBLE EXPRESS
VERSACE

AFIRE BEY V
BRAVADO BEY V
MAJOR PRECISION
BUCHAREST V
PADRONS PSYCHE
JULLYEN EL JAMAAL
IXL NOBLE EXPRESS
PICAZSO

SIR FAMES HBV

IXL NOBLE EXPRESS
NATIONS PSY
JONKER (DHH)

IXL NOBLE EXPRESS
FAME VF+

VERSACE

PREMIS

PADRONS PSYCHE
AFIRE BEY V

DAKAR EL JAMAAL
TRIFTEN+/

EXPLOSIVE MIST
LH MERCEDES
NAFISA EL SAHARA
*AA-CERISE
BACHARAH
MAGNOLYAH

AM CLEMMIES DREAM
S JUSTA SPOT

ROSA LINDA

ROHARA EMPRESS
A-SECRET KISS

ST SENSATIONAL COPY
QUEENS

VJ LOVELIGHT
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BUTTERFLY AFIRE
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LH MERCEDES
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WC TIAH
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RS FUNNY GIRL
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KHOVVER GIRL
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HL JUSTALUSION
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TF QUISARA
COGNAC STARLETT
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Grey
Grey
Chestnut
Bay

Bay

Bay
Grey
Bay
Black
Grey
Chestnut
Chestnut
Chestnut
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Black
Bay
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Grey
Grey
Chestnut
Chestnut
Bay

Bay
Chestnut
Bay

Bay
Chestnut
Bay
Chestnut
Bay
Grey
Chestnut
Chestnut
Chestnut
Bay

Bay

$500.00
$250.00
$0.00
$600.00
$4,100.00
$500.00
$1,200.00
$0.00
$500.00
$700.00
$300.00
$0.00
$500.00
$0.00
$2,200.00
$1,400.00
$700.00
$200.00
$200.00
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$0.00
$3,500.00
$1,000.00
$100.00
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$1,500.00
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$500.00
$0.00
$800.00
$4,000.00
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$2,500.00
$4,500.00
$1,000.00
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Pamelan
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Joy F.
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Sally

Joe
Harold L.
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Elise F.

Martin
Dale
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Carmelle
Tony
Jonas J.
Michael

Charlie
Timothy D.
Tony
Jonas J.
Elvin

Lisa M.
Lindsay

Hamilton
Stroud

no bid
Hoskins
Leverett
Crothers
Loden

no bid
Bontrager
Rombough
Stroud

no bid
Bishop
no bid
Troyer
Joyce
Holtvogt
Day
Flanders
Schwenn
no bid
Cranshaw
Sheldon
Vecchio
Zech
Rooker
Reid
Miller
Neff

no bid
Schwenn
Goggins
Reid
Miller
Berkheimer
Stanley

Rinehart
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QUESTIONABLE LADY GN
BE MI TOI

HCA MI FLAMING AFFAIR
NICOLETTE CF

MAGICS GOLDN FANCIE
OZ THE WIZARD
SIRICIUS

NOBLE JULIETTE

BA MIKEERA BEY
SOMEDAY

PA PANDORA EXPRESS
O FALENA
HARLEMSLITTLEDEBUTANT
MAGNIFISSANT FAME CF
JUSTAGLORY

ZA PSY CAD

BSF ESTELLA

SAFFRIN

KATALYSTT

name pending
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Arabian
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QUEST MF

TOI SOLDIER

MI LIBERTY FLAME
EA ERROGONCE
STORMS GOLDEN ACE
M A TYTANIUM
FABRICIUS

IXL NOBLE EXPRESS
BA VYAGRA BEY

A NEW DAY

IXL NOBLE EXPRESS
KRUSADE

HARLEM GLOBETROTTER

SIR MAGNI FEKE+//
GLLORIOUS
MAGNUM PSYCHE
BASKE AFIRE
KRUSADE

FIRST CYTE+
PSYOUNG

INDY (grade)

DIVINE HEIR

SA ELEGANT AFFAIR
COGNIECKA

MM FIRE MAGIC
MARINA DEL REY

LONE STAR LOVE
JEWEL DGL

KHALIA' S A

FG LILMS SOMETHIN
PALMETTO AFIRE
FOREVERR FAME
JINDALEE

DDA FAMES CONTESSA
HL JUSTAFANTASY
CADILLACS PREMIERTOWN
ELZEDA

RHR SCIMANDRIA
PADRONS NIKE
RAINBOW LADY
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Bay
Chestnut
Chestnut
Bay
Chestnut
Chestnut
Chestnut
Bay

Bay
Chestnut
Chestnut
Bay
Grey

Bay
Chestnut
Chestnut
Bay

Bay

Bay
Grey

$1,700.00 Christopher
$900.00 Allison Marie
$1,100.00 | Tony
$250.00 Jane A.
$900.00 David A.
$0.00
$3,600.00 Scott Robert
$300.00 Susan Elaine
$900.00 Lynn Marie
$400.00 Allison Marie
$300.00 Susan Elaine
$0.00
$700.00 Natacha
$300.00 Susan Elaine
$100.00 Douglas
$900.00 Sandy
$500.00 David A.
$0.00
$4,200.00 Julie
$800.00 Aaron T.

Yarmark
Grosse
Reid
Clark
Brothers
no bid
Sarkozi
Seago
Etten
Grosse
Seago
no bid
Lesburgueres
Seago
Stroud
Young
Brothers
no bid
Slack
Smith



