
Lot # Horse Name Breed Sire Dam Sex Age Color Selling Price Buyer Salutation Name Buyer Last Name
1 GIO MAGNIFICOO PPA Arabian MPA GIOVANNI LADY ECHO LC Gelding 2 Grey $500.00 James Kenneth Budd
2 GSF GENERATION X Arabian MY GENERATION AMES MERRY Gelding 2 Chestnut $10,000.00 Robin Porter
3 TEACH ME SOME TRICKS Half Arabian TRICK R TREAT+/ DARK EYED DIVA Gelding 2 Bay Tobiano $0.00 No Sale
4 APOLLO DREAMIN Arabian AA APOLLO BEY FIELDOFDREAMS BMB Mare 2 Grey $41,000.00 Robin Porter
5 R ARABELLA Arabian JULLYEN EL JAMAAL R BELLAZAR Mare 2 Bay $2,100.00 Kimberly Accurso
6 ONE HOT LOOK Half Arabian TAMAR VISIONARY IN HOT PURSUIT (APHA) Gelding 2 Bay $0.00 No Sale
7 THRILL SEEKER Arabian AFIRES HEIR SHES THE RITZ Mare 2 Bay $21,000.00 Elvin Berkheimer
8 CSP BINGO Half-Arabian DESIGNED (ASB) CSP MAMAZING Gelding 2 Chestnut $4,800.00 Renee Pelzman
9 EF TRI-N-SHOCME Arabian SF SPECS SHOCWAVE DA TRIFINITY Gelding 2 Bay $6,300.00 Renee Pelzman

10 WISE CATT Arabian BERRY BERRY WISE CATT Mare 2 Bay $0.00 No Sale
11 TAMAR IMPRESSIONIST Arabian MAIS SHAH TAMARTELYRIAELITE Stallion 2 Bay $0.00 No Sale
12 TO THE MOON CCF Half Arabian LUCKY SOL MOON (APHA) MC ZIA JABASK Mare 2 Bay Overo $800.00 Clark Thomas Travis
13 STICKY WICKET Arabian MONTECELLO PENNSYLVANIA AVENUE Gelding 2 Bay $500.00 Kimberly Accurso
15 SPIRIT OF LIBERTY HOA Arabian MAHRCAL FANCY-FREE SPIRIT Mare 2 Grey $0.00 No Sale
16 NEXT CONTESTANT Arabian AA APOLLO BEY CHIMICHANGA Gelding 2 Grey $4,500.00 Ryan Strand
17 DENNY CRANE Arabian JDM RAIN DANCE+// CP MADISON Gelding 2 Bay $0.00 No Sale
18 DUKE OF EARL SF Arabian OKW DRAKKAR FYNESSA Gelding 2 Bay $0.00 No Bid
19 THE DUTCHESS FERGIE Half Arabian VCP MAGNIFIRE TOP LINE (SHA) Mare 2 Bay $5,800.00 Marta Budd Dimeglio
20 PA SEASER ALWAYS Arabian ALWAYS A JULLYEN V SWEET SAPHIRE V Gelding 2 Bay $600.00 Carmelle Rooker
21 SWEET MELISSA JOY Half Arabian R-A KUASAR MI MARIAH Mare 2 Bay $2,700.00 Gregory M. Harris
22 TEMPTED FIRST Arabian A TEMPTATION JKF FIRST LADY Stallion 2 Bay $3,000.00 Ryan Strand
23 TAMAR BOOT SCOOTIN BOOGIE Half Arabian MAIS SHAH FIZZ WHIZ Stallion 2 Chestnut $2,100.00 Ryan Strand
24 ELEGANT EXPRESSIONS Arabian IXL NOBLE EXPRESS MG SILVERADO MINX Mare 2 Grey $0.00 No Bid
25 LJR ACES WILD Half-Arabian A WILD FIRE TOAD Gelding 2 Chestnut $0.00 No Sale
26 TEXXAS Arabian EXXPECTATION+ SF GEORGIA+/ Stallion 2 Bay $0.00 No Sale
28 NOSTALGIA LR Arabian AFIRES HEIR NOLA HPA Mare 2 Bay $1,500.00 James and Kerry Hoffman
29 MAGNIMAZING Arabian VCP MAGNIFIRE JKF JUSTAMAZING Gelding 2 Bay $3,500.00 Robyn Thieme-Sklar
30 ERA HORACIO Arabian BASKE AFIRE PAVLOVA X Gelding 2 Chestnut $6,800.00 Tod Wawzyska
31 UNZIPPED BY SIXX Half Arabian EXXPECTATION+ LIL PINE BLOSSOM (AQHA) Gelding 2 Chestnut $0.00 No Sale
32 EASTER BASKET CCF Half Arabian TAMAR VISIONARY EASTER FRECKLES (APHA) Mare 2 Bay $0.00 No Sale
33 PA WARSAW ALWAYS Arabian ALWAYS A JULLYEN V WKRA Stallion 2 Bay $1,600.00 Kathie Williams
34 LLC SERENDIPITY Arabian MAMAGE HL SERENE Mare 2 Chestnut $1,200.00 Kimberly Warren
35 TWIST OF LUCK Half Arabian LUCKY SOL MOON (APHA) BLACKBERRY TWIST Mare 2 Chestnut $0.00 No Sale
36 TAMAR GOLD RUSH Arabian MAIS SHAH FMASCARLETTLETTER Stallion 2 Chestnut $0.00 No Bid
37 CSP SOUL SISTER Half-Arabian HF MISTER CHIPS+ SISTER SISTER Mare 2 Chestnut $0.00 No Sale
38 TR ALEXA KID Half Arabian IMA DUN KID (AQHA) MWF ALEKSANDRIA Mare 2 Buckskin $13,000.00 Susan Lane
39 JUST PRESS PLAY CCF Half Arabian CLOUT MMA APRIL LOVE Gelding 2 Bay $0.00 No Bid
40 PA JUNEAU Arabian GAZAL AL SHAQAB GAI JULLYETTE Stallion 2 Bay $2,000.00 Lou and Bill Rathburn
41 JR PRIMADONA Arabian AA APOLLO BEY JR PRIMROSE Mare 2 Grey $2,000.00 Juliet Cunningham Carden
42 ERA IMA BARFLY Half Arabian TRIFTEN+/ SUE EBONY Mare 2 Bay $7,000.00 Camille Smith
43 GSF NICOLETTE Arabian VCP MAGNIFIRE AMES JLO Mare 2 Bay $8,000.00 Katherine McCarty
44 HEIRABESQUE LR Arabian AFIRES HEIR PRO-BABILITY Mare 2 Chestnut $4,000.00 James Dale White
45 CHROMED OUT COWGIRL Half Arabian LUCKY SOL MOON FNF PEARLSNLACE Mare 2 Bay $15,000.00 Diane Athey
46 DA TRIAD Half Arabian TRIFTEN+/ DA ADDICTION Mare 2 Bay No Sale
47 ERA IMON FACEBOOK Half Arabian BASKE AFIRE AMAZING GRACE PR Mare 2 Bay $500.00 Tracy A. Sera
48 RAY EL REY Arabian GR PSYCHES REY SCH PRECIOUS SILVER Gelding 2 Grey $500.00 William Jantzen
49 TRILOGY HHF Arabian TRIFTEN+/ LILLY LANGTRY Stallion 2 Bay $1,700.00 Collette McMillan
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50 ERA FABULOCITY Half-Arabian MAMAGE UNDULATA'S LADY DELIGHT Mare 2 Chestnut $6,500.00 Kevin Price
61 MUSIC NTHE AIR Arabian AFIRE BEY V MISS WISDOM Mare 9 Bay $0.00 No Sale
62 CALLAWAY'S IN THE MONEY Saddlebred CALLAWAY'S MAIN MAN CALLAWAY'S CASHFLOW Mare 7 Chestnut $4,600.00 Amanda Purdin
63 HOLLYLUYA Arabian BASKEVICH HOLLY GO LIGHTLY Mare 12 Bay $5,500.00 Bradley Alan Pettitt
64 BELLA BASKE Arabian BASKE AFIRE WHIMSEY BEY Mare 7 Bay $0.00 No Sale
65 LLC TAMAGE Arabian MAMAGE TRIFIRETTE Mare 6 Bay $3,000.00 James Kenneth Budd
68 HILLCROFT PRINCESS ROYAL Saddlebred MERCHANT PRINCE GLENDALE'S RADIANT DUCHES Mare 6 Chestnut $5,500.00 Robin Porter
69 CSP MAMAZING Arabian MAMAGE MELODONICA Mare 8 Chestnut $2,500.00 Kathie Williams
70 TO MAGICMOTION Arabian PROMOTION MAGIC SPRITE Mare 21 Bay $4,100.00 Amanda Purdin
71 DOUBLETREES GOLD ACCENT Saddlebred FOX CREEK BELLE OF MAGIC Mare 15 Chestnut $2,500.00 Mike Budd
72 ALL AGLOW SCR Arabian AA APOLLO BEY SF GDARA Mare 13 Grey $1,500.00 Donna Marie Knight
75 MAGNUM SHOWCASE CRF Arabian MAGNUM PSYCHE AMES MIRAGE Gelding 4 Chestnut $2,600.00 Richard Kamins
76 SALESMAN SAM Half Arabian WERE DUN (AQHA) ABL ANTIQUA Gelding 5 Palomino $4,500.00 Lori-Kay Frommann
77 ANNABELLE LEE PPA Arabian FAUSTO CRH TEMPTATION T Mare 1 Bay $1,400.00 Kimberly Accurso
78 MILANIA B Half Arabian BASKE AFIRE TUSCANY Mare 3 Bay $10,000.00 Rebecca Boles
79 DOCTOR MCDREAMY Half Arabian AA APOLLO BEY OUT TROT 'EM (AHHS) Gelding 3 Bay $8,500.00 Howard and Debra Booher
80 MIZTER PRESIDENT VA Arabian MHR NOBILITY MIZ MARGEAUX V Stallion 5 Chestnut $0.00 No Sale
81 SHEZGHOTTA WINSOME Half Arabian EL GHAZI RELETTA M (DHH) Mare 7 Bay $4,200.00 Rich Melville
82 LC TOI COLLECTOR Half Arabian/NSH MATOI ROYAL DEKARATION MJB Mare 4 Chestnut $0.00 No Sale
83 CASTLE IN THE SAND Saddlebred CASTLE BRAVO ENDLESS LEGACY Mare 2 Chestnut $4,000.00 Robin Porter
84 CSP ROBERT REDFORD Half-Arabian REGAL BASQUE+/ VANITY'S GAL Gelding 6 Chestnut Overo $0.00 No Sale
85 NEXT BIG THING Half Arabian BASKE AFIRE COOKIN' SHERRY Gelding 4 Bay $1,300.00 Howard and Debra Booher
87 BELIZARBI Arabian ESMET ARBI AER BELIZAMA Mare 7 Bay $0.00 No Sale
88 DOMINOE BEY Arabian AA APOLLO BEY MORNING EL GHAZA++++/ Mare 3 Grey $1,300.00 Gloria Castellanos
89 BEUKEBOOM Half Arabian HUCKLEBEY BERRY+/ LADY O'SHEA Gelding 12 Chestnut $4,200.00 Lindsay Renee Rinehart
90 MAXIMUM VELOCITY WP Arabian SEMPER FIE OOH MY MY Stallion 1 Chestnut $1,400.00 Lou and Bill Rathburn
91 HR FREEZE FRAME Half Arabian LEGION VF MH PICTURE PERFECT (Grade) Mare 5 Grey $900.00 Tony Reid
92 RAS SOMLIKE THEMBLOND Half Arabian PA HI-NOON XOCHIL (AQHA) Mare 3 Palomino $0.00 No Sale
93 RIPTIDE VA Arabian TRIFTEN+/ RAMONA V Stallion 3 Bay $15,000.00 Kimberly Accurso
94 HIGHPOINT'S BULGARI Saddlebred ULTIMATUM HIGHPOINT'S PETAL PUSHER Mare 15 Chestnut $1,100.00 Elvin Berkheimer
95 GEENA DAVIS Half Arabian AFIRE BEY V THE SMALL TOWN BLUES Mare 6 Chestnut $2,600.00 John Ames
96 I HEAR THEM TOO Half Arabian AA APOLLO BEY I HEAR VOICES Mare 3 Bay $2,800.00 Jennifer Quintus
97 LC REGAL DEKERATION Half Arabian/NSH REGAL BASQUE+/ ROYAL DEKERATION MJB Gelding 5 Grey $4,000.00 Kathie Williams
98 FANCY-FREE SPIRIT Arabian HB NABORAK MY FREE SPIRIT Mare 9 Grey $1,100.00 Denise McCreery
99 QUEEN BE Half Arabian BASKE AFIRE HIGHPOINT'S QUEENSLAND Mare 6 Bay $4,200.00 Lou and Bill Rathburn

100 POPULAR ROMANCE Half Arabian BASKE AFIRE PRECISELY POPPY Mare 4 Chestnut $5,600.00 Renee Pelzman
101 BSF TRINITY and her 2009 colt by WERE DU Arabian SCIMARON DREAM GAL Mare 6 Bay $3,000.00 Lou and Bill Rathburn
102 BASQUELLE PR Arabian BASQUERO PR SS SABRINA Mare 6 Bay $700.00 Robert Talamante
103 APOLLUTE VYNDYKATION Arabian AA APOLLO BEY JKF JUSTAMAZING Stallion 3 Bay $1,365.00 Nancy Miller
104 AKS LADY FIRE Arabian TRIFTEN+/ AKS BARBARY AFIRE Mare 7 Bay $900.00 Deborah D. Voyt
105 MATONSK Arabian ZODIAC MATADOR+ MADANSKA Gelding 12 Bay $2,700.00 Andrew Amsden
106 PRINTZ W Arabian MAGNUM PSYCHE BRASS PRINCESS Gelding 7 Bay $1,400.00 Kathie Williams
107 FLIRTIN WITH FAME Half Arabian VERSACE TAMAR DIAMOND DESTINY Mare 1 Bay $1,500.00 Ryan Strand
108 EXXTRA FANCY Half Arabian EXXPECTATION+ FANCY ROMANCE Mare 1 Bay Tobiano $0.00 No Sale
109 HIGH TIME'S MASQUERADE Saddlebred SUPREMACY'S HIGH TIME STYLING CENTER Mare 11 Chestnut $0.00 No Bid
110 AMBITIONS AFIRE Arabian AFIRE BEY V TC MATADOR MISS Mare 7 Chestnut $3,500.00 Robin Porter
111 BOHEMIAN RHAPSODY SF Half Arabian BASKE AFIRE ADMIRAL'S LOTUS BLOSSOM Mare 4 Bay $0.00 No Sale
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112 MW MADIERA Arabian MHR MUSCATEAL MARLIERA Mare 10 Chestnut $5,500.00 Kristi Herbst
113 DA REVOLUTION Arabian AFIRE BEY V TENDER MERCIES Gelding 6 Grey $6,500.00 Kathie Williams
114 TOP LINE Show Horse Alliance/Renai TOP SPOOL (ASB) SUPER KEMMA H (DHH) Mare 6 Chestnut $30,000.00 Robin Porter
115 BSF APHRODITE Half Arabian BASKE AFIRE BELIEVER'S EIGHTIES LADY Mare 3 Chestnut $900.00 Gloria Castellanos
116 AMES JLO Arabian MATOI FERACHASK Mare 6 Chestnut $800.00 Amanda Purdin
117 JS SHES ALL THAT Half Arabian A MAJOR FIRE NEW YORK ROSE Mare 7 Bay $2,000.00 Christine Gilmour
118 TOI CAPPUCCINO Half Arabian MATOI SULTANS CAPPUCCINO Mare 10 Bay $2,500.00 Kimberly Accurso
119 CHIXX ZIP ME Half Arabian EXXPECTATION+ ZIPPOS MICHELLE Gelding 1 Chestnut $0.00 No Sale
120 JR PHANTASY Arabian APOLLOPALOOZA JR PHYLICIA Mare 6 Grey $13,500.00 Renee Pelzman
121 TO DYE FOR Half Arabian BASKE AFIRE FLYING SOLO G.S. Gelding 7 Bay $2,100.00 Vi McNeill
122 FRENCH SPLENDOR Arabian BPA SPLENDOR+ FRENCH FANCY Gelding 5 Bay $1,100.00 Bruce Burton
123 ALTAR EGO Arabian AFIRE BEY V HOLLYLUYA Gelding 3 Chestnut $1,200.00 Robert Talamante
124 BUCKSHOTS TWENTY X Half Arabian WERE DUN (AQHA) BSF FIRST LADY Gelding 1 Bay $0.00 No Sale
125 TAMAR AMERICANA Half Arabian MILLENNIUM LOA+ JEWEL'S CLASSIC SPRING Mare 3 Chestnut $500.00 Patty Campbell
126 WWILL I AM Arabian AFIRES HEIR NOBILITYS LADY DI Stallion 1 Chestnut $24,000.00 Elvin Berkheimer
128 ALLELUJA Half Arabian HEY HALLELUJAH++// EL SAKE Mare 7 Black Bay $2,800.00 Vi McNeill
129 GHAZI BEYBERRY Arabian SUNSTONE BEY CYMBEL GHAZA Mare 11 Bay $2,100.00 Stanley White
130 AFIRE CATT Arabian BASKE AFIRE MISS KITTY CATT Mare 5 Bay $2,900.00 Teresa S. Craig
131 PANDORAS LUCK Half Arabian LUCKY SOL MOON (APHA) KRA PANDORAS BOX Mare 0 $0.00 No Sale
132 KING OF POP Half Arabian BASKE AFIRE PRECISELY POPPY Gelding 6 Bay $3,900.00 Angie Sullivan
133 STEPPIN ON FIRE Half Arabian AFIRE BEY V ULINDE (DHH) Mare 4 Bay $10,000.00 Nathan Salamy
134 FALICITY Half Arabian FALCON BHF PREMIER PROPERTY Mare 8 Grey $5,700.00 Tony Reid
135 TAMAR SPYRO GYRA Half Arabian TAMAR ODYSSEY MISS DIAMOND BREEZE Mare 4 Black Tobiano $800.00 Lou and Bill Rathurn
137 JR ROSEMARY Arabian APOLLOPALOOZA JR PRIMROSE Mare 7 Bay $1,100.00 Robin Porter
138 ONLY MAN IN TOWN Half Arabian BASKE AFIRE THE SMALL TOWN BLUES Gelding 4 Chestnut $3,500.00 Kevin Price
139 BUCKSHOTS MAGGIE MAE Half Arabian HS JUSTATEMPTATION SOUL KISS++/ Mare 1 Chestnut $0.00 No Bid
140 LLC WYN RAVE Arabian RAVE VF KF DINA Gelding 9 Bay $900.00 Robert Talamante
141 SO SEXXY IN GEORGIA Arabian EXXPECTATION+ SF GEORGIA+/ Mare 4 Chestnut $7,200.00 Renee Pelzman
142 INCREDIBLE FLIGHT Half Arabian ARMANI FC SADINE (DHH) Gelding 5 Chestnut $17,000.00 Patricia Mayer
143 ROYAL DEKERATION MJB Saddlebred ANDEKER ROYAL ENVY Mare 17 Chestnut $0.00 No Bid
144 SF AFIRE Arabian BASKE AFIRE KAREDIN KAMEO Gelding 7 Bay $2,000.00 Richard Goodrow
145 HOLLY HOCHS Arabian AFIRE BEY V HOLLYLUYA Mare 4 Chestnut $3,200.00 Rebecca Louise Upchurch
146 TAMAR MAIS BE BABY Arabian MAIS SHAH FANCIE FERRARI Mare 3 Black $1,000.00 Texco Financial Corp.
147 TAMAR EMISSARY Arabian EMANOR BEY CARNIVAL Gelding 8 Grey $19,000.00 Steven D. Strange
148 CHIMICHANGA Arabian BEY SHAH ZAM CHIMICHINGA Mare 14 Grey $4,200.00 Karen B. McLamb
149 SILANTRA RTA Arabian PYRO THYME SA SEPHORA Mare 3 Chestnut $2,600.00 Lou and Bill Rathburn
150 GIMME THREE STEPS Half Arabian/NSH FORTY SECOND STREET ERB CTC FELICITY Mare 3 Bay $1,000.00 Kristi Herbst
151 BSF CHELSEA Arabian HS JUSTATEMPTATION BSF GALEXIA Mare 1 Grey $600.00 Lou and Bill Rathburn
152 RED WHITE AND BLUES Half Arabian BASKE AFIRE THE SMALL TOWN BLUES Gelding 6 Bay $3,200.00 Cathy Seeton
153 BLAST MASTER Arabian BASKE AFIRE MORGAN LE FAY Gelding 4 Chestnut $0.00 No Sale
154 JR PAULA Arabian AA APOLLO BEY JR PENELOPE Mare 4 Grey $1,100.00 Debra Booher
155 TR MAJOR SNO STORM Half Arabian MAJOR SNO CHEX PORTENA Gelding 4 Chestnut Roan $3,200.00 Vickie Schraudner
157 SIMPLY MAGIK Half Arabian MAJESTEIT (DHH) CANDELITE Gelding 6 Grey $2,100.00 Bruce Burton
158 THE DANCIN QUEEN Half Arabian IXL NOBLE EXPRESS WHERE'S THE QUEEN Mare 3 Chestnut $6,000.00 Stanley White, Jr.
159 AFIRE BRAND Half Arabian BASKE AFIRE THE SMALL TOWN BLUES Gelding 4 Chestnut $2,700.00 Kimberly Warren
160 TQ TSHIMERA Arabian TOSKABI ROHARA TSOLITAIRE Mare 7 Chestnut $4,100.00 Jospeh E. Prichard
161 POLITICALLY CORRECT Half Arabian/NSH THE VISCOUNT TAXING AFFAIR Gelding 9 Chestnut $3,500.00 Bethany A. Burke
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162 RAIN CRYSTAL Arabian JDM RAIN DANCE+// RV CRYSTAL BEY Mare 3 Bay $3,000.00 Cathy L. Seeton
163 ERA GEORGE DUBYA Half Arabian ULYSSES R HR BEY SILK+ Gelding 3 Bay $0.00 No Sale
164 NOBLE KRYZTELITA Arabian IXL NOBLE EXPRESS CRYZTAL NOVA Mare 3 Bay $900.00 Lou and Bill Rathburn
165 TAMARCAPUCCINOCOWBOY Half Arabian TAMAR FINAL TRIBUTE CF LOVE ON FIRE (grade) Gelding 4 Bay Tobiano $700.00 Robert Talamante
166 LJR I LYK IT LYK THAT Half Arabian/NSH COLOGNE CALLAWAY'S EVENING LINE Gelding 10 Grey $1,300.00 Bonnie J. Novak
167 ALL CHAZZED UP+/ Half Arabian MCA CHAZZ WHY NOT DIAMONDS Gelding 8 Chestnut $4,200.00 Stacy M. Plonte
168 JUST BEGHAZ CP Arabian EL GHAZI EARLY PROMISE Gelding 9 Bay $0.00 No Sale
169 BOY CRAZY Half Arabian BASKE AFIRE THE SMALL TOWN BLUES Mare 4 Bay $3,500.00 Bruce Cochran
170 XTREME REDEMPTION Half Arabian XTREME PHLASH+// REDEEMING SILVER (APHA) Gelding 4 Chestnut Tobiano $2,100.00 Kristi Herbst
171 PSYCHIC MOUN Arabian MAGNUM PSYCHE MYSTIC MOUNBEY Gelding 11 Bay $2,700.00 Michelle Davis
172 TAMAR DURANGO Half Arabian NEPOSZAR+ grade Gelding 6 Bay Tobiano $800.00 Karen Hesse
173 NOBLES ANGEL Arabian IXL NOBLE EXPRESS AFIRES EXPOSE Mare 4 Bay $2,200.00 Rob Farnacci
174 HUCKS PRELUDE V with 2009 foal Arabian HUCKLEBERRY BEY++ MHR PRINCESS BASK Mare 17 Bay $1,700.00 Lou and Bill Rathburn
175 ZM MICRO MACHINE Half Arabian BUTTERSCOTCH BAY STARLITE (grade) Gelding 8 Bay $0.00 No Sale
176 SS BOY GENIUS Half Arabian TBO BEYBOY BASK WILD AND LOVELY PH Gelding 8 Bay $15,500.00 Stanley White, Jr.
177 JB A MAITRE D Arabian MONARCH V JBA PARTY GIRL Gelding 5 Chestnut $2,900.00 Winifred Longares
179 PA JERICHO KID Arabian SUNDANCE KID V GAI JULLYETTE Gelding 4 Bay $3,200.00 Scott Unick
180 JUSTICE BY AFIRE HHF Arabian V PADRONS JUSTICE LILLY LANGTRY Mare 3 Bay $800.00 Texco Financial Corp.
181 B GLAMOUROUS Half-Arabian BASKE AFIRE ROYAL THREADS Mare 6 Bay $700.00 Robert Talamante
182 JB MISS INDEPENDENT Arabian MONARCH V JBA PARTY GIRL Mare 4 Chestnut $1,000.00 Elvin Ervin
183 SATINE Half-Arabian CANADIAN COGNAC CARAMEL MOON Mare 7 Chestnut $1,200.00 Winifred Longares
184 A LITTLE ON FYRE Half-Arabian/NSH DOLOROSA'S ROYAL FLUSH ON FYRE Mare 8 Chestnut $1,000.00 Karen Hesse
185 BLADE LL Arabian JAAYD BELINDAA Gelding 7 Chestnut $5,000.00 Winifred Longares
186 GTF MING JADE Half-Arabian IMP SUDDIE MARKSMAN (AHH ENCHANTRESS PR Mare 8 Bay $0.00 No Sale
187 DR ALLPSYCHED UP Arabian PADRONS PSYCHE DR ROSA LINDE Gelding 13 Bay $1,100.00 Paula Ziegelgruber
188 ER SPUR OFTHE MOMENT Half-Arabian RB MENESSON HA SOLAR EXPRESS Mare 5 Chestnut $0.00 No Bid
190 WON MORE TIME WPE Arabian AMES CHARISMA GOLDIE AGAIN Mare 2 Chestnut $0.00 No Bid
191 CR ROYAL RAVEN Arabian BEAUNAFIDE BEY TELABBIE Mare 2 Black $500.00 Debra Smith
192 BAS CISCO Arabian TR ALADAHEAT SHANTILLE Gelding 3 Chestnut $500.00 Robert Talamante
193 DESERT PEARLL Arabian DESERT HEAT VF MISS IRRESISTABLE Mare 7 Chestnut $500.00 Lou and Bill Rathburn
194 TR SITTIN PRETTY American Quarter Horse RADICAL RODDER CHIP DOT COMM Mare 7 Bay $0.00 No Bid
195 CHARLIE BROWN GA Arabian MADDOX VAN RYAD DESTIMONA Gelding 1 Bay $0.00 No Bid
196 S JUSTA TEMPTER Arabian JUSTAFIRE DGL ENCHANTRESSE Gelding 6 Bay $1,100.00 Sandra Kelley
197 TR DAZEE DUKES Half Arabian ZEE MEGA BUCKS TOUCHDOWN LADY (AQHA) Mare 4 Bay $0.00 No Bid
198 EUROSONG Arabian EUROPIA+ IRISH LOVE SONG Gelding 9 Grey $1,300.00 Kelly Collins
199 GAI SAMURAI Arabian SANADIK EL SHAKLAN GAISHEA Gelding 5 Grey $1,700.00 Richard Kamins
200 GOLDIE AGAIN Arabian FALK LLORA GEZAN Mare 8 Chestnut $0.00 No Bid
201 TR SUNDANCE DOT COM Half Arabian SUNDANCE KID V CHIP DOT COM (AQHA) Mare 1 Bay $0.00 No Bid
202 LLC PRYME TAMALE Arabian PRYME THYME RC HOT TAMALE Mare 3 Chestnut $500.00 Donna Marie Knight
203 MI MORENA GA Arabian MADDOX VAN RYAD MI OBSESSION Mare 1 Bay $0.00 No Bid
204 BAS RACKETEER Arabian TR ALADA LEGACY TR ALADDINS CAMEO Gelding 3 Chestnut $700.00 Karen E. Hesse
205 TR TANTALUS Half Arabian ZIPS CHOCOLATE CHIP HILONIA HCF Stallion 1 Bay $2,700.00 Robin Porter
206 PA MAY WEST Arabian DA JOHN WAYNE MAY DANCER V Mare 3 Bay $3,000.00 Kimberly Accurso
207 SHAKEY JAKE Half Arabian QH CALYPSO BAY MN MISS KEEMO Gelding 11 Bay Tobiano $2,000.00 Lisa Skalski
208 CCR STARBUCKS Half Arabian BEY TRIBULASHAHN MIDNITE TO DAWN (AQHA) Mare 4 Buckskin $900.00 Deanna Gray
210 CHAMPAGNE BLAZE V Arabian AUTUMN BLAZE V+ CALIPHS LIDIZJA Mare 14 Bay $0.00 No Bid
211 DIXIE REBEL LC Half Arabian/NSH PHILANDER BEY+// ROYAL DEKERATION MJB Mare 3 Bay $0.00 No Bid
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212 AMES SUPREME Arabian BRASS CARNELLO Gelding 6 Bay $1,100.00 Bruce Burton
213 BELLISSIMO GA Arabian FAUSTO UNIC STAR Gelding Chestnut $0.00 No Bid
214 TR BELLA LUNA Half Arabian ZIPS CHOCOLATE CHIP MWF ALEKSANDRIA Mare 1 Bay $0.00 No Bid
215 HANNIJA SF Arabian HORIZJON DAAL KIANA Mare 6 Grey $500.00 Susan Seago
216 SUCEED Arabian FALCON BHF CHALLURE LOA Gelding 3 Chestnut $500.00 Kyle McCarty
217 BAS RASKEL Arabian TR ALADA LEGACY MASQUERADE A H Gelding 3 Bay $500.00 Karen Hesse
218 HR ZODIAC HERITAGE Arabian MATTAMAN MAE WEST E Mare 1 Bay $0.00 No Bid
219 PA SANNTANA Arabian VERSACES GOLD SWEET SAPHIRE V Gelding 1 Black $1,000.00 James White
220 HILONIA HCF Arabian *LYPHARD *PR STRIKETTE Mare 17 Bay $700.00 Lynne Rowlett
221 BEAUMONT BEY HH Arabian AFIRE BEY V MAS FOREVER MINE Gelding 3 Chestnut $0.00 No Bid
222 ARMONI GA Arabian MAGNUM PSYCHE MI RADIANCE Gelding Chestnut $800.00 Joe Alberti
223 SW HOT SHAHT Arabian BEY SHAH+ MC SUMMERS JABASK Gelding 12 Grey $1,100.00 Irene S. Aborn
224 PHILADELPHIA FREEDOM Arabian PHILANDER BEY+// AVITA MSC Mare 3 Grey $600.00 Texco Financial Corp.
225 I'M A KNOCKOUT Saddlebred PRIZE CONTENDER BILLIE VALENTINE Mare 7 Chestnut $1,200.00 Oris Miller
227 HR FANCI FREE Arabian BA BEY ELATION FANCY-LADY Mare 18 Grey $1,600.00 Rob Bick
228 IMARI FALINA QUEST Arabian IMARI ENCORE ANW SHOWQUEST Mare 7 Bay $500.00 Susan Seago
229 HL SERENE Arabian THE CHIEF JUSTICE SERANIDA Mare 18 Bay $900.00 Denise McCreery
230 PA APRIL AFFAIR Arabian TRIFTEN+/ AFIRES AFFAIR Mare 3 Bay $600.00 Gloria Castellanos
231 BAS SAMSON Arabian TR ALADAHEAT SAMBRENA Gelding 3 Grey $700.00 Robert Talamante
233 TR MIKHAIL TOTHECHIEF Arabian SJ MIKHAIL+++// ICE STORM TC+// Gelding 3 Bay $500.00 Jennifer Quintus
234 PC TRINITY Arabian ALLIENCE+// BRAVADO RHOZ Gelding 4 Grey $500.00 Joan Hellen
235 MSU SOLARIS Arabian AFIRE BAY FLAME TEENANGEL Gelding 6 Chestnut $2,500.00 Richard Goodrow
236 POKER FACE Half Arabian BAYGEYM+/ DOCS LITTLE SHEBA (grade) Gelding 4 Chestnut $600.00 Randy Meyer
237 SHAMPAGNE PSYNSATION Half Arabian PSYNTENIAL BAY SBOS J KIMBE (AQHA) Mare 3 Buckskin $700.00 Lou and Bill Rathburn
238 HH ANGEL BERRI Arabian VF VANGUARD MISS BERRI V Mare 11 Bay $1,100.00 James Budd
239 AFIRE OF GOLD Arabian LEGACY OF GOLD SC FIREFLY Mare 11 Bay $500.00 Pamela J. Carlson
240 LORECE Saddlebred SANTANA'S CAMEO FABLE'S ENCHANTED HEART Mare 21 Bay $900.00 Amanda Degand
241 STAR OF GEMINI GA Arabian MAGNUM PSYCHE BAY DESTINY Mare 1 Bay $500.00 Texco Financial Corp.
242 IVORY MAGNOLIA Arabian MAG HR GUCCI GUCCI Mare 10 Grey $0.00 No Bid
243 PA MAGNOLIA Arabian TRIFTEN+/ MAGGIE MAY V Mare 1 Grey $600.00 Carol Ann Darnell
244 TR SUNSET TIDAL WAVE American Quarter Horse TIDAL WAVE JACK SAMBA AT SUNSET Mare 2 Bay $500.00 Angela M. Sullivan
245 HERSHEYS KISS GE Arabian SOUL MAN FOREVER PADRONA Mare 8 Black $900.00 Carolyn Shephard
246 LC PHYLLIS DILLER Arabian PHILANDER BEY+// MATOIS BARBELLA Mare 4 Grey $700.00 Gloria Castellanos
247 FAME FEMME FATALE Arabian FAME MAKER R PAPILLONS KALLIMA Mare 13 Grey $2,500.00 Hussain Fahed H. Aljamaher
248 CHIP DOT COMM American Quarter Horse ZIPS CHOCOLATE CHIP ILINI SKIP ELENA Mare 12 Bay $1,000.00 Stanley White
249 CHANTILLY LACE GA Arabian MADDOX VAN RYAD MIDNITE LACE Mare 1 Black $500.00 Texco Financial Corp.
250 MANDOLINA SF Arabian MOMENTUS MG WC APRILS TRICK Mare 3 Chestnut $500.00 Christine Tupper
251 SAHRA FARAS Arabian THEE DESPERADO MINSTRILS ISIS Gelding 4 Chestnut $500.00 Paula Ziegelgruber
253 PA DAKOTA Arabian EVG GENTRY DREAMS OF GOLD Stallion 1 Bay $0.00 No Bid
255 SHES GOT SKILLS Half Arabian BABYLON BEY V WHY NOT DIAMONDS Mare 4 Chestnut $2,600.00 Deanna Gray
256 WC FUTURE Arabian FALCON BHF LC PSOUTHERN STAR Gelding 7 Grey $2,800.00 Cindy Aube
257 LOT OF BASK HH Arabian A TEMPTATION LOT OF WISDOM Gelding 4 Grey $500.00 Robert Talamante
258 GIANNI VERSACE Arabian VERSACE DESPERADOS VIXEN Gelding 1 Bay $600.00 Marian Buehler
259 VALENCYA HCF Arabian *LD HALSTON *FAMES DREAM Mare 12 Chestnut $900.00 Lou and Bill Rathburn
260 FOXY FLEUR Arabian FOXFIRE BHF TEMPTATION T Mare 3 Grey $600.00 Gloria Castellanos
261 LC TRIPLEPLAY Arabian DA TRIPOLLI AVITA MSC Gelding 5 Bay $700.00 Bruce Burton
262 BALOO ANGEL Arabian MFA HULLABALOO SATINSHERIE AMORE Mare 9 Bay $1,000.00 Richard Kline



Lot # Horse Name Breed Sire Dam Sex Age Color Selling Price Buyer Salutation Name Buyer Last Name
263 LC JOHN GOTTI Arabian EA ECHSTRAVAGANT GG APHRODITE Gelding 5 Chestnut $500.00 Amanda Degand
264 SHE'S CUSTOM MAID Saddlebred MERCHANT PRINCE PERFECT ORDER Mare 5 Bay $500.00 Ryan Strand
265 TR BAGHERA Arabian RAHERE BALOO ESSENCE Stallion 1 Bay $0.00 No Bid
266 JUSTADARE HH Half Arabian JUSTAFIRE DGL LIL JOSIE TEXAS (APHA) Gelding 5 Bay Tobiano $1,800.00 Carrie J. Baxter
267 SS AMIRA ZHANNA Arabian RD GUCCI RD SOLITAIRE Mare 10 Grey $500.00 Christine Tupper
268 POLLY POCKET Half Arabian BABYLON BEY V SANTANA BEY Mare 4 Bay $500.00 Lou and Bill Rathburn
269 BALOO ESSENCE Arabian MFA HULLABALOO KO TSASHA Mare 16 Bay $500.00 Lou and Bill Rathburn
270 AVITA MSC Arabian TRAVIS MSC AFERA Mare 13 Bay $900.00 Joe Molloy
272 FOXY CONTESSA Arabian FOXFIRE BHF MISS ESCADA Mare 3 Grey $700.00 Debra Smith
273 TR LIGHT MY FIRE Arabian WHAT IT TAKES+ MESQUITE FIRE Mare 1 Bay $500.00 Gordon Potts
274 GAA LATISHAH Arabian LARK RMC GAA LIE-SHAH Mare 4 Chestnut $0.00 No Bid
275 HARLEMS BRIGHT STAR Half-Arabian/NSH HARLEM GLOBETROTTER NDL ESPERANZA Mare 9 Chestnut $2,300.00 Tony Reid
278 OPTIMUS PRIME PVF Arabian ODYSSEY SC CANDELITA SF Stallion 1 Bay $1,700.00 Gloria Castellanos
279 JUSTA BASKE Arabian BASKE AFIRE HL JUSTA MOTION Gelding 4 Bay $500.00 Kimberly Warren
280 GSF PASSIONATEAFFAIRR Arabian APOLLOPALOOZA A MAJOR AFFAIRR Mare 5 Bay $500.00 Catherine Cravens Whitaker
281 SS DESPICABLE Arabian DESPERADO V HL ALISSTA Gelding 10 Bay $2,500.00 Andrew Amsden
282 MYSTIC SCHNAPPS Arabian NEW TSTANDARD INTREPID LADY Gelding 4 Grey $0.00 No Bid
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